Viele
Kaski

A Plus
RJS

KTM
Alliance
Stack Bros
Dirt Inc
Carleton
TPEC
Peterson
G Urban

Property 1

Bids not awarded

Cutoff
$1,800.00
$1,858.82
$3,900.00

$3,500.00

$4,400.00

$1,875.00

$9,995.00

$2,250.00

$1,600.00
no bid

Demo Total Bid
$9,225.00 $11,025.00
$12,260.00 $14,118.82
$7,550.00 $11,450.00
no bid
no bid
$14,280.00 $17,780.00
$8,869.00 $13,269.00
$5,800.00 $7,675.00
$22,488.00 $32,483.00
$6,250.00 $8,500.00
$8,400.00 $10,000.00
$12,000.00 $12,000.00

Cutoff

$2,300.00
$3,576.47
$6,000.00
$4,400.00
$8,963.50
$4,300.00
$4,400.00
$3,475.00
$9,995.00
$4,250.00
$2,200.00
no bid

Property 5

Demo
$35,160.00
$32,352.94
$52,000.00

$105,600.00
$62,065.41
$48,500.00
$31,000.00
$44,400.00
$28,495.00
$38,000.00
$30,800.00
$20,000.00

Total Bid

$37,460.00
$35,929.41
$58,000.00
$110,000.00
$71,028.91
$52,800.00
$35,400.00
$47,875.00
$38,490.00
$42,250.00
$33,000.00
$20,000.00

Cutoff
$1,200.00
$2,141.18
$3,900.00
$4,300.00
$6,856.72
$4,000.00
$4,400.00
$1,875.00
$9,995.00
$1,500.00
$1,000.00

no bid

Demo
$9,195.00
$11,214.71
$11,270.00
$38,700.00
$29,297.70
$10,878.00
$9,920.00
$13,890.00
$22,493.00
$6,250.00
$9,700.00
$14,000.00

Property 10

Total Bid
$10,395.00
$13,355.88
$15,170.00
$43,000.00
$36,154.42
$14,878.00
$14,320.00
$15,765.00
$32,488.00
$7,750.00
$10,700.00
$14,000.00

Property 12

Cutoff
$2,500.00
$3,070.59
$5,800.00
$4,200.00

$13,302.41
$3,800.00
$4,400.00
$3,850.00
$9,995.00
$4,250.00
$2,800.00

no bid

Demo

$18,670.00
$20,168.72
$25,000.00
$25,800.00
$32,519.53
$16,200.00
$14,879.00
$24,890.00
$22,487.00
$21,000.00
$18,750.00
$16,000.00

Total Bid

$21,170.00
$23,239.31
$30,800.00
$30,000.00
$45,821.94
$20,000.00
$19,279.00
$28,740.00
$32,482.00
$25,250.00
$21,550.00
$16,000.00

Cutoff

$2,000.00
$4,188.24
$5,800.00
$4,420.00
$9,470.69
$3,500.00
$4,400.00
$3,450.00
$9,995.00
$4,250.00
$2,500.00
no bid

Demo
$9,371.00
$12,841.18
$8,105.00
$29,580.00
$22,386.05
$10,800.00
$12,000.00
$10,850.00
$21,420.00
$10,000.00
$7,900.00
$13,500.00

Property 14

Total Bid

$11,371.00
$17,029.41
$13,905.00
$34,000.00
$31,856.74
$14,300.00
$16,400.00
$14,300.00
$31,415.00
$14,250.00
$10,400.00
$13,500.00

*Awarded Bids are highlighted.
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